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AGENDA

TOWN BOARD WORK SESSION
Wednesday, October 9, 2013 7:00pm

Pledge of Allegiance - Moment of Silence

Town Board Work Session:

1. Councilman Jonathan Schneider, Glenn Droese, Town Assessor, John Wolham,
NYS Office of Real Property — Consider Proposals for Town Wide Reassessment

2. Michael Simone, Highway Superintendent — Consider Awarding Bid for the
Purchase of Capital Equipment

3. Ronald Gainer, PE, Town Engineer — Consider Attendance to NY Stormwater
Conference Seminar — Qctober 16, 2013

4. Sgt. Robert Behan, Carmel Police Department - Consider Tuition
Reimbursement ($4,228)

5. Police Chief Michael Johnson — Consider Declaring Old Equipment Obsolete

= Public Comment (Three (3) Minutes on Agenda Items Only)
¢« Town Board Member Comments

Open Forum:

s Public Comments on New Town Related Business (Three (3) Minutes
Maximum per Speaker for Town Residents, Property Owners & Business
Owners Only)

* Town Board Member Comments
Adjournment

Executive Session:

1. Budget Fiscal Year Ending 2014 — Personnel



Pasguerello,Anne

From: Mike Simone <msimone@bestweb.net>
Sent: Friday, October 04, 2013 12:34 PM
To: Pasquerello,Anne
Cc: Schmitt, Kenneth; Spofford, Ann; gfolchetti@aol.com; msimone@bestweb.net
Subject: October 9th Work-Session Agenda ~ Bid Award - 10 Wheel Cab & Chassis
%Vork Session {© } 0.// E
Anne,
O Agenda

Please place the Highway Department on the October 9" Town Board Work-Session Agenda.
Michael is awarding the Bid of the 10-Wheel Cab & Chassis to:
Mid Hudson Mack @ $129,161.50
There were lower bids, however:
® Tracey Road Equipment Inc— Bid-specs NOT MET

s Beam Mack Sales & Service Inc — Bid WITHDRAWN per email...

From: Greg Angwin [mailto:grega@beammack.com]

Sent: Friday, October 04, 2013 8:50 AM
To: 'Mike Simone'

Subject: RE: New Mack Specs
Importance: High

Mike,

Please accept this email as Beam Mack’s request to withdraw from the 2014 tandem axle bid on Oct 3,
2014. Itis with deep regret, Beam Mack cannot participate in this bid at the stated at the stated price in
the bid.

Beam Mack greatly appreciates your consideration in this matter. If you have any questions or
cancerns, please do not hesitate to contact us.

Beat Regards

Greg

Greg Angwin

Beam Mack Sales and Service Inc.

6260 East Molloy rd.

East Syracuse N.Y. 13057

P:315-437-2574

F:315-437-3794

C: 315-254-5910

grepa@beammack.com

As always, thanks for all you do....

c%w%m for

Michael Simone, Superintendent of Highways
Town of Carmel Highway Department
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Pasguerello,Anne

From: Gainer,Ron

Sent: Woednesday, October 02, 2013 9:28 AM

To: Schmitt, Kenneth; Frank Lombardi; suzi medonough; Suzi McDonough; John Lupinacci;
Jonathan Schneider

Cc: Pasquerello,Anne; Greg Folchetti

Subject: Southeast New York Stormwater Conference Attendance

Attachments: 2013_seny_conference_brochure.pdf

Pls find attached a program cutline discussing an upcoming Southeast NY Stormwater Conference, to be put on by the Lower
Hudson Coalition of Canservation Districts at the Dutchess Manor in Beacon on October 16, 2013, which | would like to attend. The
seminar’s focus is on "Green Infrastructure for Wet Weather: Cleaner Water and Safer Communities”, and will specifically address

the following topics:

e latest on green infrastructure (G}, highlighting ways green infrastructure techniques could make communities more
resilient to severe weather

= NYS Stormwater Program updates

= floodplain management policy, preservation of green infrastructure, and discussion on funding options

The Town Board’s authorization of this request would be appreciated. The cost of the seminar is only $125.00. Should you have any
questions, please let me know.

Ronald J. Gainer, PE, Town Engineer
TOWN OF CARMEL

60 McAlpin Avenue

Mahopac, NY 10541

(845) 628-2087; fax (845) 628-7085
email: rg@ci.carmel.ny.us

This communication may be confidential and is intended for the sole use of the addressee(s). No use or reproduction of the information provided is
permitted without the written consent of the Town of Carmel. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not copy, disclose or take any action
in reliance on this communication. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender by reply e-mail and delete the message
and any ottached documents,




The Southeast New York Stormwater
Conference and Trade Show

13th Annual

Southeast New York
Stormwater Conference
and Trade Show

The Lower Hudson Coalition of
Conservation Districts

www.lhccd.net

Including Soil and Water Conservation
Pistricts in the counties of Albany, Columbia,
Dutchess; Greene, Mew York City, Orange;
Putnam, Rensselaer; Rockland, Ulster and
Westchester

OCTOBER 16, 2013
Beacon, New York

Green Infrastructure
for Wet Weather:

Cleaner Water &
Safer Communities

The Dutchess Manor
263 Route 9D
Beacon, NY 12508
845-831-3650
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www.dutchessmanor.com

c/o0 Dutchess Co. SWCD
2715 Route 44, Suite 3
Millbrook, NY 12545

presented by
The Lower Hudson Coalition of

Owernight accommodations may be found neaby
in Mewburgh and Fishkill.

Conservation Districts




Registration Form

Please register by clipping and returning this form with
your payment by October 4. You can also register
on-line with a credit card at www.lhced.net.

Name

Affiliation/Business

Street Address

City State Zip Code

Telephone Fax

Email Address

Please indicate which concurrent sessions you plan to attend.

10:15am (A or [B
1:00pm OA or (1B
2:00pm OA or [B

After October 4 $ 125.00
Registration includes breakfast, lunch, and coffee breaks

Payment Options:
Check or Purchase Order:
Make payable to Dutchess County SWCD
Mail this form & payment to:
Dutchess County SWCD
Attn: Conference

2715 Route 44, Suite 3
Miilbrook, NY 12545

Credit Card:

Register on-line at www.lhccd.net

Pay by credit card through Paypal on our website,
{No Paypal account required)

Sorry, no refunds after QOctober 7. Purchase orders and
vouchers will be charged even if you do not attend.
Registration questions? Contact fennifer Lusk at

Jjennifer lusk@ny.nacdnetnet or 845-677-8011 x3

8:00

8:30

9:15

10:00

10:15

[1:30

12:00

1:00

2:00

3:00

3:30

4:15

Southeast New York Stormwater Conference Agenda
October 16,2013

Continuing education credits for professional engineers are offered by
Mid-Hudson Consulting Civil Engineers Society

Conference Check-In and Continental Breakfast
Welcome, LHCCD News and NYS Stormwater Program Updates

Keynote: Severe Weather, Flooding and Green Infrastructure
Franco Montalto, e-Design Dynamics

Break

A. Gravel Wetlands for Stormwater Management: Wappingers Falls pilot
Matt Alexander, Mayor, Village of Wappingers Falls; Steven Gruber, Renewage;
David Whitney, PE, Renewage, EcoSolutions, UVM

B. Floodplain Management: How changing federal policies affect your town
Bill Nechamen, CFM, NYS DEC

Trade Show Break
Lunch

A. Green Roof Basics: Requirements, performance and financial benefits
Inger Staggs Yancey, RA, GRP, Brooklyn Greenroof, LLC

B. Natural Green Infrastructure: Landscape-scale mapping, site planning strategies
Amanda LaValle, Ulster County Dept. of Environment; Bonnie Franson, AICP, H2M

A. Piant Selection for Green Infrastructure Practices
Pete Muroski, Native Landscapes
B. Green Infrastructure Case Studies &€ Lessons Learned in NYC Parks
Tannen Printz, Green Infrastructure & Jeff Keiter, Sustainability Coordinator, NYC Parks

Trade Show Break

Funding Green infrastructure
Panel of Agency Representatives

Wrap-Up




Carmel Police Department
Mahopac, New York 10541

TO:; Supervisor K. Schmitt [g/ka Session 109 {,%
FROM:  SgtR Behaﬁ/ﬂ(ﬂ// -
B Agenda
DATE: September 24, 2013
RE: Tuition Reimbursement Request — Spring/Summer 2013

| am requesting 50% reimbursement under the PBA Contract, Article XVI| —
Education and Training, Section 5 for the following classes as a requirement for a
degree in Homeland Security Leadership and Policy. This degree meets the
requirement of “police related courses” since the degree emphasizes
management skills, such as needs assessment, human resources, training,
diversity, and emergency management. This program takes public safety
leadership to those who are looking to lead their fields in public service
leadership, such as criminal justice.

Please find attached invoices paid for BTM7107, MGT7019, SKS7000, and
BTM7104, with my grades for those ciasses. There are no additional fees or cost
for textbook. For the each class the invoices are for $2,114 for a total paid
$8,456. Per the contract 50% is eligible for reimbursement for a total of $4,228.

Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions or concerns.



Learner Programs
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\ Learners

'Learner Programs

hitps://learers.ncu.edu/LearnerPrograms/Default.aspx?

Robert Behan

Logout

p

Home EBTM7102-8 EBIHS7000-8 Learner Programs Message Financial Library Writing Center Univ

_J Learner Programs

LOA

Other Forms

RBA

Degree Plan

(Click on the above link to see your Degree Plan)

Course Start | Course End | Break | Grade

BIM7101-8 3 03/04/2013
02/25/2013

MGT7019-8 3 03/25/2013
SKS57000-8 3 05/20/2013
BTM7104-8 3 06/17/2013
H57000-8 3 08/26/2013
BTM?7102-8 3 09/23/2013
HS57004-8 3 11/25/2013
BTM7103-8 3 12/23/2013

HS7010-8 3 02/24/2014

HS7013-8 3 03/24/2014
BTM7106-8 3 05/26/2014

HS7014-8 3 06/23/2014
BIM7109-8 3 08/25/2014
CMP9400B 3 09/22/2014
DIS9401B 3 12/22/2014

DIS9402B 3 01/19/2015
DIS94038 3 04/20/2015

DIS94048 3 05/18/2015

Show XML

04/28/2013
04/21/2013

05/19/2013
07/14/2013
08/11/2013
10/20/2013
11/17/2013
01/19/2014
02/16/2014
04/20/2014
(05/18/2014
07/20/2014
08/17/2014
10/19/2014
12/14/2014
03/15/2015
04/12/2015
07/12/2015
08/09/2015
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Please click one of the links in t

9/24/2013 11:35 PM



(3 monmmeraran
Invoice
Date: 2/18/2013

Learner ID # 0352148493
Robert Behan

50 Woodland Trail
Carmel, NY 10512

Course Code: BTM7101-8

Course Description: Foundations for Study in Advance Degree in Business
Course Start Date: 2/25/2013

Course End Date: 4/21/2013

Units Per Course: 3

Cost Per Course: $2114.00

Accounting Department
Phone: 1.888.327.2877
Fax Number: 928.443,5267
Email: acct@ncu.edu
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Invoice

Date: 3/20/2013

Learner ID # 0352148493
Robert Behan

50 Woodland Trail
Carmel, NY 10512

Course Code; MGT7019-8

Course Description: Ethics in Business
Course Start Date: 3/25/2013

Course End Date: 5/20/2013

Units Per Course; 3

Cost Per Course: $2114.00

Accounting Department
Phone: 1.888.327.2877
Fax Number: 928.443,5267
Email; acct@ncu.edu
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Invoice

Date: 5/15/2013

Learner ID # 0352148493
Robert Behan

30 Woodland Trajl
Carmel, NY 10512

Course Code: SKS7000-8

Course Description: Comprehensive Strategic Knowledge Studies
Course Start Date: 5/20/2013

Course End Date: 7/14/2013

Units Per Course: 3

Cost Per Course; $2114.00

Accounting Department
Phone: 1,888.327.2877
Fax Number: 928.443.5267
Email: acct@ncu.edu
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Invoice
Date: 6/14/2013

Learner ID # 0352148493
Robert Behan

50 Woodland Trail
Carmel, NY 10512

Course Code: BTM7104-8
Course Description: Statistics I
Course Start Date: 6/17/2013
Course End Date: 8/11/2013
Units Per Course: 3

Cost Per Course: $2114.00

Accounting Department
Phone: 1.888.327.2877

Fax Number: 928.443.5267
Email: acct@ncu.edu
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From: Johnson, Mike
Sent: Thursday, October 03, 2013 10:21 AM
To: ‘frank lombardi’; "Johanthan Schneider’; Lupinacci,John; Pasquerello,Anne; Schmitt,
Kenneth; 'Suzi McDonough'
Subject: Request by the Mahaopc School District

| received a request from Mr. Earl Bellows, a Mahopac School board member, who requested if the Town could donate a
light bar to the school district for their security vehicle,

We have an extra light bar that we are not utilizing and probably will never utilize again, because it is the older model
that draws a lot of electric current. The school district plans to utilize yellow lenses on the light bar so that it will not
have the red and blue lights that a normal police vehicle would possess. The light bar is a Whalen Edge 9000 light bar---
a serial number was not found on the equipment. The equipment was originally donated to us by the Mahopac FD and
was formally utilized on the police boat. Please advise me if you approve of this donation of excess equipment.



