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TOWN BOARD WORK SESSION
Wednesday, June 14, 2023 7:00pm

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE - MOMENT OF SILENCE
6:30pm Executive Session:
1. Litigation Update — Melchner v Town of Carmel
RECOGNIZING THE FIRST RESPONDERS, CARMEL POLICE DEPARTMENT AND VOLUNTEERS WHO
ASSISTED IN SAVING THE LIFE OF A YOUNG GIRL FROM CARDIAC ARREST

Public Comments on Town Related Business (Five (5) Minutes Maximum for Town Residents,
Property Owners & Business Owners Only)

Town Board Work Session:

o Review of Town Board May 17, and June 7, 2023

Carmel Town Board/James Gilchrist, Director of Recreation & Parks: Updates on

a. Airport Park —James Gilchrist

b. Swan Cove/Downtown Revitalization Project — Supervisor Cazzari

c. Comprehensive Plan — Councilwoman McDonough

Michael Carnazza, Building & Codes Enforcer-Consider Request to Advertise for Bids Per the Property
Maintenance Code of the Town of Carmel-11 Meadow Drive & 28 Duke Drive, Carmel

Michael Carnazza, Building & Codes Enforcer- Consider Request to Accept Bid for Property Cleanup
TM#44.17-1-45

Michael Carnazza, Building & Codes Enforcer — Consider Request to Return Difference in Permit Fee —
TM#87.9-1-17 - 534 Overlook Drive South ($417.00)

Michael Carnazza, Building & Codes Enforcer — Consider Request to Return Permit Fee for Solar Panels —
TM#44.2-12 - 251 Fair Street, Carmel ($432.00)

Michael Simone, Highway Superintendent — Consider Request to Declare Old Equipment Obsolete and
Authorize Disposal (2007 Eager Beaver- Trailer #2)

Consider Request to Waive the Notice Requirement in Section 64 of the New York State ABC Law with
Respect to a Liquor License for Blackfoot, LLC d/b/a Olde Tyme, NY

Richard Franzetti, PE, Town Engineer — Consider Request to Award Bid - Chemical Supplies for the
Various Town Water and Sewer Districts

Mary Ann Maxwell, Town Comptroller — Consider Budget Revisions April/May 2023 - -#2023/03

Town Board Comments

Motion to Move into Executive Session

Executive Session:

1. Consider Settlements of Litigation
2. Police Chief Anthony Hoffmann — Personnel
3. Mary Ann Maxwell, Town Comptroller — Personnel

Motion to Adjourn Meeting
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SEAN’S LAWNS & LANDSCAPE CORP.
c/o Sean Hagan
P.O. Box 620
BALDWIN PLACE, NEW YORK 10505
(845) 621-1549 (914) 248-7670

PROFOSALSUBMITTEDTO//[)L v\’ 0( (Aff\'\a/’ C/ /"{ /(g([}(‘ NAT, DATE 5/ ?/ / ;2 3

ADDRESS /4# 1” _\/\ Ub\&/ A\'t Pg}c;hf{ 59;2 (937> e

DATE OF PLANS

CArang\ Y SAN
JOB NAME AND LOCATION ARCHITECT
C \0ANUD Q"‘QQ?S"A/\ G5
) JOB PHONE

~ {qj(,,)_g 1500

We hereby submit specifications and estimates, subject to all terms and conditions as set forth on both sides, as follows:

To ot 5\ ComSicoctiso Makrial,

%A < r\UW\Q S \\kr & ‘)L,\) cho Q"o (NS

QN},O:\/\ [%rf MO %ug F DO CoC 165>
> pa  Mile

ACLAS..... Do \odKsS.

(Read Reverse Side)

e I&lrupuze hereby to furnish material and labor — complete in accordance with above specifications,

for the sum of: ’?/7‘“') r'i'\) 'F-I(I-('. AUNJF&J dollars ($£ZQM)

NOTE: This proposal may be withdrawn by us if

]
Authorized ﬁ « 96[",
days. Signature .

not accepted within

Afl:?pt?h: The above prices, specifications and

conditions are satisfactory and are hereby accepted. You

Signature

are authorized to do the work as specified. Payment will be
made as outlined above.
Date Slgnalure




May 11, 2023

Town of Carmel
Attn: Mike Carnazza
60 McAlpin Avenue
Carmel, NY 10512

We propose herby to furnish material, equipment and labor necessary
for the completion of:

* Removal of all construction Material, Gas Pumps, Litter and Debris
From the Property (1 Fowler Ave, Carmel )

e Property will be Mowed, Trimmed, and Blown

We Propose hereby to furnish and labor - complete in accordance with
above specifications for the sum of: $8795.00 All work to be completed
in a substantial workmanlike manner according to specifications
submitted, per standard practices. Any alterations of deviations from
above specifications involving extra costs will be executed only upon
written orders, and willbecome an extra charge over and above
estimate.

Sincerely

Edward Spadaro, owner
Clear View Landscaping, LLC
914-804-8554




Mike’s Blue Wheel Service. Inc.
www.mikesbluewheels.com

225 Wood Street, Mahopac, New York 10541

845.528.3889 Telephone* 845-528.0051 Fax
mikesbluewheels@optimum.net

Complete Lawn Maintenance

Supply Yard Location: 160 Bryant Pond Rd, Mahopac, NY 10541

May 02, 2023

Town of Carmel

Attn: Michael Carnazza, Building Inspector

60 McAlpin Ave

Mahopac, NY 10541

Re: Property Cleanup - 1 Fowler Ave, Carmel, NY

The price quoted below is for the following:

Removal of all construction material including cashier enclosure, gas pump, litter and all debris from
the property.

Mowing, trimming and raking for leaving the site clean.
This work will require dumpster service, excavator for loading , trucking, a landscaping and

construction crew.

Total Project Price....$11,500.00

Thank you for giving us the opportunity to quote you on this project.

Sincerely,

Mike's Blue Wheel Service Inc



6/14/2023 WORK SESSION AGENDA ITEM #4

Michael G. Carnazza (845)628-1500
Director of Code Enforcement Ext. 170

60 McAlpin Avenue
Mahopac, New York 10541

To: Supervisor Michael Cazzari
Town Board
/M/%
From: Michael Carnazza, Building Inspector [
Date: June 7, 2023
Re: Fee Refund- 534 Overlook Dr. South, Mahopac
Tm#87.9-1-17

Please be advised, on 11/18/2022, the owner of the above-referenced property was issued a
permit for an addition to a one family dwelling. I incorrectly charged for an additional 1,400
square feet ($2,225.00) when it should be 1,122 square feet ($1,808.00).

Can you please return the difference in the fees of $417.00 to the owner(s):
Thomas and Julie Judge

534 Overlook Drive South

Mahopac, N.Y. 10541

Thank you,

Tel: (845) 628-1500 ext. 170 Fax: (845) 628-7085 email mgc@ci.carmel.ny.us
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Michael G. Carnazza (845)628-1500
Director of Code Enforcement Ext. 170

60 McAlpin Avenue
Mahopac, New York 10541

To: Supervisor Michael Cazzari

Town Board [ {\ 0
From: Michael Carnazza, Building Inspector i! \‘ '
Date: June 7, 2023
Re: Fee Refund- 251 Fair St., Carmel

Tm# 44.-2-12

Please be advised, on 10/13/2022, the contractor, Sun Power Corporation Systems, for the above-
referenced property was issued a permit for solar panels on the roof of their one-family dwelling.
The parcel straddles the town line between Carmel and Southeast but the house is in Southeast,
therefore, the permit should have been issued by the Southeast Building Inspector.

Can you please return the fee of $432.00 to the Contractor:
Sun Power Corporation Systems

400 Executive Blvd., Suite 137

Elmsford, N.Y. 10523

Thank you,

Tel: (845) 628-1500 ext. 170 Fax: (845) 628-7085 email mge@ci.carmelny.us




Town of Carmel
Building Department

Building Permit
Date: 10/13/2022 SBL: 44.-2-12 Permit # 22-1252

APPLICATION IS HEREBY MADE to the TOWN OF CARMEL Building Department for the issuance of a permit
pursuant to the New York State Uniform, Fire Uniform Fire Prevention and Building Code, for the construction of
buildings, additions or alterations, repairs, or for the removal or demolition, as herein described. The Contractor agrees to
comply with all applicable laws, ordinances, or regulations governing building activities in the TOWN OF CARMEL and will
also allow all inspections to enter the premises for inspections. The Contractor also understands that under no
circumstances shall personal belongings or furnishings be brought into any new house or addition, without first obtaining a
Certificate of Occupancy from the Building Department.

Contractor Information Owner Information
Name Name Alexander J Law
Address Address 251 Fair St _/‘i [Ov e llS‘ (/c/ - - ;,

‘Carmel, NY 10512

>

Phone Phone

Address of Construction: 251 Fair St
Project Description: Roof-Mounted Solar Panels

I am also aware of the required inspections and that I am responsible to schedule them.

Signature
This building permit shall become void (18) months from the date of issuance and construction must be substantially
commenced within 6 months of the date of issuance.
Amount Check#_/5 / (_12_

Fee Type
Certificate of Compliance Residential $80.00 Date /1 / o[ 23
Building Permits $352.00 Amount Collected - 3, 2

s ‘
Total Due: $432.00 Initials (]//71,74

The application of Alexander J Law Dated 10/13/2022 is hereby APPROVED and permission GRANTED for the
construction, reconstruction qr alteration of a building and/or accessory structure as set forth above and on
the plans approved,a nd z\ar by the Building Department.

/I
V' Signature m)

60 McAlpin Avenue Mahopac, New York 10541 (845) 628-1500

Website: www.ci.carmel.ny.us
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LAW OFFICE OF
BRUNO V. GIOFFRE, JR., PLLC

707 WESTCHESTER AVENUE, SUITE 305-A
WHITE PLAINS, NEW YORK 10604

Admitted in NY, CT & FL TELEPHONE (914) 481-8900
FACSIMILE (914) 481-8905

bruno@bgioffrelaw.com g e

June 8, 2023 = RECEIV & !

Via Overnight Mail s 2 N |

Town Clerk NFRoon08 o |

Town of Carmel ;\E«[ L

60 McAlpin Avenue e A |

Mahopac, New York 10541 [ .,

Re: Notice to Municipality of RW Application for
Blackfoot LL.C dba Olde Tyme NY

Dear Town Clerk:

On behalf of our client, Blackfoot LLC dba Olde Tyme NY, we hereby notify you
pursuant to Alcohol Beverage Control Law, Sections 64, Subdivision 2a and 99D, that
our client intends to file a Restaurant/Wine License serving wine, beer and cider for its
premises located at 1895 Route 6, Carmel NY 10512. Enclosed herewith is the NYS
Liquor Authority (“SLA”) Standardized Notice Form for your review.

Our client is hoping to open this summer.
Accordingly, we respectfully request that the Town of Carmel, waive the statutory
thirty (30) day waiting period to allow our client to file these applications with the SLA

as soon as possible. Please advise the undersigned of the Town of Carmel’s position at
your earliest convenience.

Thank you for your consideration. Should you have any questions, please do not
hesitate to call.

Very truly yours,

Law Office of Bruno V. Giofftre, Jr., PLLC
.

/ Bruno V. Giofftre, Jr.,E ,
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Richard J. Franzetti, P.E.
Town Engineer

(845) 628-1500
(845) 628-2087
Fax (845) 628-7085

Office of the Town Engineer
60 McAlpin Avenue
Mahopac, New York 10541

MEMORANDUM

To: Carmel Town Board

From: Richard J. Franzetti P.E. Town Engineer

Date: June 12, 2023

Re: C 285- Chemical Supply to various water and sewer districts

Bids were received for the referenced supply contract on June 9, 2023. The Bids were opened
by the Town Clerk. A copy of the bid opening results is attached. The scope of work involves
chemical supply to various Town of Carmel water and sewer districts.

Three (3) bids were tabulated as identified on the attached spread sheet. Based on the results
the following recommendations are made:

e Slack, based on the estimated quantities identified in the contract documents would be
$109,545.46

e Surpass, based on the estimated quantities identified in the contract documents would
be $91,634.85

e Coyne Chemical, based on the estimated quantities identified in the contract documents
would be $12,488.00 (ltem #7-CSD#2)

Chemicals for the Districts are included as part of the annual budget. | respectfully request that
this matter be placed on the next available work session for discussion.

Tel: (845) 628-1500 Fax: (845) 628-7085 email rijf@ci.carmel.ny.us

G:\Engineering\Contracts and RFPs\C290 - Chemical Supply\To TB\06-12-2023 C290 Chemical Supply - Recommendation to TB
(Autosaved).doc


















Coyne Slack Surpass
District| Item#| MOD Chemical|  Unit Cost ~ Ext Cost|  Unit Cost Ext Cost|  Unit Cost  Ext Cost

csd2 #5 gallons caustic soda 25% 2.447 5,628.10 2.2530 5,181.90
csd2 #4]  gallons caustic soda 50% 2.743 7,406.10
csd2 #7]  gallons sulfuric acid| 7.7800 | 12,448.00 8.439 13,502.40
csd2 #8]  gallons citric acid 17.0800 854.00 13.974 698.70
csd4 #7|  gallons sufuric acid 11.8900 713.40 8.439 506.34

csd4 #4]  gallons caustic soda 50% 2.743 754.33 4.5480 1,250.70

csd4 #8|  gallons; citric acid 17.0800 1,281.00 13.974 1,048.05 9.8600 739.50
csd5 #2|  gallons| chlorine (carboys ~ summer) 18.1953 10,917.18 5.440 3,264.00
csd6 #2|  gallons| chlorine (carboys ~ summer) 22.2109 5,552.73 5.440 1,360.00

csd7 #6 gallons aluminum chlorohydrate 9.3400 7,005.00 13.750 10,312.50 7.9870 5,990.25
csd? #2|  gallons chlorine 41.3906 1,241.72 4.990 149.70
csd7 #8]  gallons citric acid 40.2700 1,409.45 14.974 524.09

cwd2 #1|  gallons; phosphoric acid 27.7461 | 83,238.30 21.247 63,741.00 15.7960 | 47,388.00

cwd2 #2 gallons chlorine 4.147 35,249.50 3.6570 | 31,084.50
cwd2 #3 Ibs diatomaceous earth 1.294 84,110.00
cwd3 #2|  gallons chlorine 5.440 3,264.00
cwd8 #2|  gallons; chlorine 1,800g 5.4098 9,737.64 11.440 20,592.00
cwd8 #2|  gallons chlorine 460g 8.990 4,135.40
cwdl2 #2|  gallons chlorine 15.7858 5.440 3,372.80
12,448.00 109,545.46

G:\Engineering\Contracts and RFPs\C290 - Chemical Supply\bid results.xIsx




CSD #2 WWTP at Old Route 6, Carmel {Carmel Hamlet]

Contract 290~ Chemical Supply

Material Estimated Unit Price | Unit Price Bid words Extension
quantity Bid Bid price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
ltem # 5 Caustic Soda 2,300 gallons S2.447 Two dnd’ foor hundred| $5,628.10
25% forty-seven Ehousandfils
[tem #4 Caustic Soda 2,700 gallons $2.743 Two and seven hundred| ¢7,406/10
50% forty-three thousandths
ltem #7 Sulfuric Acid 1,600 gallons $8.439 Efght and four hundrefd$13,502.40
50% thirty-nine thousandths
ltem #8 Citric Acid 50 gallons $13.974 |Thirteen and nine ™. ['$698.70
111|n::|v-ed gevenky oy
##$65.00 Refundable Container Deposit ;:hou;andths aby-rour
on all drums & delboys.
CSD #4 WWTP at North Road, Mahopac {Lake Secor Sewer District)
Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
item #7 Sulfuric Acid 60 gallons 58.439 Eight and four hundred $506.34
50% thirty=fitne thousandths
Item #4 Caustic Soda 275 gallons S 2.743 Two and seven hundred| $754.33
50% forty-three thousandths
Item # 8 Citric Acid 50% | 75 gallons $13.974 Thirteen and nine $1,048.05
hundred—geventy-four
%%$65.00 Refundable Contéainer Depogit thousandths iy
on all drums & Belboys
CSD #5 WWTP at Carey 5t, Mahopac (Hillsdaie Sewer District)
Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
Item # 2 Chlorine 600 gallons $5.44 Five and forty-féur |$3,264.00

*%%$10.00 Refundable Contalner Deposit
on all 5-gallon €arboys

cents

€SD #6 WWTP at Vineland Road, Mahopac {lvy Hills Sewer District)

Page 16



Contract 290- Chemical Supply

Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
Item # 2 Chlorine 250 gallons S 5.44 Five and forty-four $1.360.00
%%$10.00 Refundabte Container Deposit GeRts
on all 5~gallon Carboys
CSD #7 WWTP at Dahlia Drive, Mahopac {Buckshollow Sewer District)
Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
item # 6 Aluminum 750 gallons $ 13.75 |Thirteen and seventy-| $10,312.50
chlorohydrate five cents
ltem 2 Chlorine 30 gallons $ 4.99 Four and nimety-nine | $149.70
— - cents —
Item # 8 Citric Acid (50%) | 35 gallons $14.974 |Fourteen and nine $524.09
%%6%.00 Refundabié Container Deposit hundred——seventy=four
on all drums & delboys thousandths
CWD#2 WTP at 1744 Route 6, Carmel, New York {Carmel Hamlet)
Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity B_'d words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
ltem # 1 Phosphoric acid | 3,000 gallons $21.247 |Twenty-one and two 63,741.00
hundred forty-seven thousandthg
Item # 2 Chlorine 8,500 gallons $4.147 Four and one hundred §35 » 249,50
forty-seven thousandth ]
Item # 3 Diatomaceous 65,000 pounds $1.294 One and two hundred $84,110.00
earth ninety-four thousandths
*#%$65.00 Refundable Container Deposit on all drums & delboys
CWD#3 WTP - 105 Spring Road, Mahopac, New York
Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
ti .
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
Item#2 Chiorine 600 gallons $5.44 Five and forty-four |$3,264.00

CWDHI8 WTP - 71 Heather Drive, Mahopac, New York

CEULS

Page 17"




Contract 290- Chemical Supply

Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity Bld words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
Item #2 Chlorine 1,800 gallons S$11.44 Eleven and forty-fouy $20,592.00
cents :
Item #2 Chlorine in 460 gallons $8.99 Eight and ninety-nine | %,135.40
gallon containers cents

CWD#12 WTP- 77 Jennifer Lane, Mahopac, New York

Material Estimated Unit Price Bid Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity dollars words Bid )I:rlce
Estimated
quantity
Item #2 Chlorine 620 gallons $ 5.44 Five and forty- $ 3,372.80
four. cents

%¥%310.00 Refundablé Container Deposit

VENDOR’S NAME: Slack Chemical C8., Inc.
ADDRESS: PO Box 30/ 465 South/cmm, NY 13619

SIGNED:

DATE: May 17, 2023

PRINTED NAME & TITLE: Derek Davis, General Manager

Affix
Corporate Seal

SCHEDULE A

Page 18



Coune s

€ HEMICAWL

May 18, 2023

(U

Attn: Ann Spofford, Town Clerk
Town of Caimal

Office of the Town Clerk

Town Hall

60 McAlpin Avenue

Mahopac, NY 10541

Bid Due: May 2, 2023 @ 11:00 A.A

Bid Title: C2£0; Cazmical <nd Diziomeceous Ez:th Supply for To n of Carmel
“aer and Ser~er Diccrict:

Please see the enclosed bid submission.
May we please have a tabulation of the bids received after the referenced bid opening?

If it would be convenient, you may fax the results to the following: Attn; Bid Department at
(215) 785-1585, or email them to BidAdministration@CoyneChemical.com.

Thank you.
Sincerely,
George S. Coyne Chemical Co.,Inc.
Bid Administration Department
George S. Coyne Chemical Company, Inc. 3015 State Road, Croydon PA 19021

PHONE 215-785-3000 Fax 215-785-1585 ORDERs orders@coyncchemical.com



Contract 220— Chemical Supply

CSD #2 WWTP at Olc Route 6, Carmel (Carmel Hamlet)

Material Estimztcd Unit Price | Unit Price Rid words “xtension
quantity Bid Bid price
dollars Csdimated
quantity
ltem # 5 Caustic Soda 2,300 gallons $No Bid No Bid $No Bid
25%
Item #4 Caustic Soda 2,700 galions $No Bid No Bid $No Bid
50%
Iltem #7 Sulfuric Acid 1,600 gallons 5 7.78/gal Seven Dollars and Seventy-Eight Cents | $12,448.00
50% per Gallon
ltern #8 Citric Acid 50 gallons $17.08/gal Seventeen Dollars and Eight Cents per Gallon | $854,00
CSD #4 WWTP at i'orth Road, Mahopac (Lake Secor Se ver District}
Material Estimated Unit Price Uni: Price Bid Extznsion
Quentity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimaiad
guantity
[tem #7 Sulfuric Acid 60 gallons s 1 189/gal Eleven Dellars and Eighty-Nine Cents per
50% Gallon $7 13 40
Item #4 Caustic Soda 275 gallons $No Bid No Bid No Bid
50%
item # 8 Citric Acid 50% 75 ga"ons S 1708/ga1 Seventeen Dollars and Eight Cents per Gallon $ 1,28100
CSD #5 WWTP at Caroy St, Mahopac (Fillsdale Sewer District)
Material Estimzted Unit Price Unit Price Bid Trtension
Quantity Bid words Bid Prica 3 .
dollars cstimated
quan.i:
item # 2 Chlorine 600 gallons $18.1953/gal Eighisen Dollr od One Thousand Ning Hurced $10,917.18
CSD #6 WWTP at Vineland Road, Mahopac (Ivy Hills Sewer District)
Page 16
aeege s Covma Chemuent Co | Ine
1% Hate Road
fror don, PA 1901

Piwne (215} 785-2000
Fax (15) T85-1585
E-Mall beiadmnistration@coynechamizal. com



Contract 290- Chemical Supply

Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity Bid words Sid Price X
dollars Estitnated
quantiy
ltem # 2 Chlorine 250 gallons $22,2109/gal vy T Dollers and T Thousand O Hsred $5,552.73
CSD #7 \WWTP at Dahlia Drive, FMzhopzc [Evckshollow’ Sevrer District)
Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid =xtension
Quantiz Bid words Bid 7rice X
doliars cstimated
gquanti.y
[tem # 6 Aluminum 750 gallons $9.34/gal Nine Dollars and Thirty-Four Cents | $7,005.00
chlorchydrate per Gallon
Item 2 Chlorine 30 gallons $41.3906/gal | Forty One Dollrs s Thre Thousmnd Niee, | $1,241.72
Item # 8 Citric Acid (50%) 35 gallons S4027}'ga1 Forty Dollars and Twenty-Seven Cents per Gallon s 1,409,45
CWD#2 WTP ct 1744 Route 6, Ccrmel, New York (Carmel Hamlet)
Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price 3id Extension
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
Bidding on CP-70. Minimum 2 drums per delivery quantity
Item # 1 Phosphoric acid | 3,000 gallons $27.7461/gal Tweoty Seven Dollasand Seve Thousnd FowrHundred | 5 83 238,30
Item # 2 Chlorine 8,500 gallons $No Bid No Bid $No Bid
Item # 3 Diatomaceous 65,000 pounds $No Bid No Bid $No Bid
earth
CWDit3 WTP - 105 Spring Road, Mahopac, New York
Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extencion
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
Item#2 Chlorine 600 gallons SNo Bid No Bid SNo Bid
CWDi#8 WTP - 71 Heather Drive, Mahonz¢, New York
Page 17

Leorge ¢ Coyne Chemical So. inc
015 Stale Povd
*rozdon. PO 19021
Pwne (215) TRE-2000
rex: (2151 785-1568
E-Huit




g ;’;; Contract 290—- Chamical Supply P ,
Material Estimated Unit Pric2 Unit Price Bid IXcansion
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Cstimated
quantity
Item #2 Chlorine 1,800 gallons $5.4098/gal Fiwg:ﬂmﬁ;;gﬁg_ﬁg}g;j‘gf@ $9,737.64
Item #2 Chlorine in 460 gallons $No Bid No Bid SNo Bid
gallon containers
CWD#12 WTP- 77 Jennifer Lane, Mahonac, Nevs York
Material cstimatad Unit Price Sid Unit Price Cid Extension
Guantity dollars words Bid ;:I‘ICE
Estimatec
quantity
Item #2 Chlorine 620 gallons $15.7858/gal e e e g et | $9,787.20
VENDOR’S NAME: George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.
ADDRESS: 3015 State Road, Croydon, PA 19021
SIGNED: k
/ 'L/ﬂ
DATE: 05/18/2023
PRINTED NAME & TITLE: John V. Drzewicki, Director of Sales
See Amendment Attached
Affix
Corporate Seal
Page 13
ms;:;:;lt;h;rml('n . Inc
e
Phone: (215) 785-3000
rax {2i6) Tub 1546

E-Mall tndadranmirston@eovnechenical.com



Contract 290— Chemical Supply

BID FORM

CSD #2 WWTP at Old Route 6, Carmel {Carmel Hamlet)

Material Estimated Unit Price | Unit Price Bid words Extension
quantity Bid Bid price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
Item # 5 Caustic Soda 2,300 gallons $ “TWO Point T o 0@ 3
25% 2:253 | Yhree 51%(.%
Item #4 Caustic Soda 2,700 gallons S L S
50% Y B 190G
Item #7 Sulfuric Acid -1,600 gallons S Ny S
50% o 8 cCﬂ
Item #8 Citric Acid 50 gallons N
8 ” o Red. ’
CSD #4 WWTP at North Road, Mahopac {Lake Secor Sewer District)
Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
guantity
Item #7 Sulfuric Acid 60 gallons S \
50% Na Redl
Item #4 Caustic Soda 275 gallons S Four poiat i ve Rear
50% 4. 5%R& Sy AT T
Itemn # 8 Citric Acid 50% | 75 gallons vAe Pos ot S
i "q.3¢ [V W SCx 15239.50
CSD #5 WWTP at Carey St, Mahopac (Hillsdale Sewer District)
Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity -
Item # 2 Chlorine 600 gallons 5 .
: na Bid >

B e e B e e ] e e ——
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Contract 290— Chemical Supply

CSD #6 WWTP at Vineland Road, Mahopac {lvy Hills Sewer District)

Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
Item # 2 Chiorine 250 gallons S S S
;s na 8
CSD #7 WWTP at Dahlia Drive, Mahopac {Buckshollow Sewer District)
Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
item # 6 Aluminum 750 gallons s NIAR Pourt AR Egihd | S
chlorohydrate 2.9%) Seyea s990.a5"
ltem 2 Chlorine 30 gallons S . S
8 N Bdd
| # 8 Citric Acid (50% 35 gallons
tem itri (50%) g S wa Bc\ot_ S
CWD#2 WTP at 1744 Route 6, Carmei, New York (Carmel Hamlet)
Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
Item # 1 Phosphoric acid | 3,000 gallons S one Five Paint Seven |§
p g 15,36 :ﬁae s‘zs‘ =rod 47,379.40
Item # 2 Chlorine 8,500 gallons s Turee pos ¥ o S
: 3657 |"Seven KIL AL
Item # 3 Diatomaceous 65,000 pounds S S
earth W& e :0\
CWD#3 WTP - 105 Spring Road, Mahopac, New York
Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
Item#2 Chlorine 600 gallons S S

W 8
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CWD#8 WTP - 71 Heather Drive, Mahopac, New York

Contract 290- Chemical Supply

Material Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity Bid words Bid Price X
dollars Estimated
quantity
Item #2 Chlorine 1,800 gallons )
8 pWa B
Item #2 Chlorine in 460 gallons S
gallon containers na Bid
CWDi#12 WTP- 77 Jennifer Lane, Mahopac, New York
Material Estimated Unit Price Bid Unit Price Bid Extension
Quantity dollars words Bid )l:rrce
Estimated
quantity
Item #2 Chlorine 620 gallons S \
& Na E¢dd >

VENDOR’S NAME:

Surfass Chamean! Go. Tuc

ADDRESS:

SIGNED:

gamyy W7 (S30F

DATE: 5’_/(7/:93

PRINTED NAME & TITLE:

Steen 3. Et(me Jice fresidend

Affix
Corporate Seal




TOWN OF CARMEL
BUDGET REVISIONS APRIL-MAY 2023 #2023/03

6/14/2023 WORK SESSION AGENDA ITEM #9

INCREASE DECREASE
BUDGET USES & USES &
ACCOUNT TITLE & TRANSFER DESCRIPTION
T‘EJ\;IIISBII(E)Q ACCOUNT SOURCES OF | SOURCES OF
FUNDS FUNDS
GENERAL FUND
1 100.1410.0019 [TOWN CLERK OTHER COMP 1,740.00
100.1440.0019 [ENGINEERING OTHER COMP 2,920.00
100.7020.0019 [RECREATION OTHER COMP 2,482.00
100.1989.9877 |(FUND BALANCE FOR COMPENSATED ABSENCES * 7,142.00
- PROVIDE FOR PAYOUT OF ACCRUED VACATION TIME
2 100.7110.0019 [RECREATION MAINTENANCE OTHER COMP 8,222.00
100.1989.9877 (FUND BALANCE FOR COMPENSATED ABSENCES * 8,222.00
PROVIDE FOR PAYOUT OF ACCRUED TIME FOR RETIREE
3 100.3120.0024 [POLICE ACCIDENT REPAIRS 10,860.00
100.1989.2681 (INSURANCE RECOVERY - ASSET * 10,860.00
- PROVIDE FOR POLICE VEHICLE REPAIRS FROM INSURANCE CLAIM
4 100.3120.0029 [POLICE SPECIAL EQUIP GRANTS - SEIZED ASSETS 365.00
100.1989.1522 |POLICE SPECIAL REVENUES - SEIZED ASSETS * 365.00
- PROVIDE FOR PRICE ADJUSTMENT FOR PURCHASE OF DISPATCHER
CHAIRS
5 100.3120.0029 [POLICE SPECIAL EQUIP GRANTS - SEIZED ASSETS 3,500.00
100.1989.3389 |GRANT AID - POLICE EQUIP/OTHER * 3,500.00
- PROVIDE FOR PURCHASE OF WATER RESCUE KITS FROM GRANT FUNDING
6 100.7114.0040 [RED MILLS CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 1,700.00
100.1989.3041 |[STATE AID - OTHER GOVERNMENT * 1,700.00
- PROVIDE FOR SHOWCASE OF LOCAL ARTISTS WITH EXIBITION OF
OUTDOOR SCULPTURES FROM GRANT FUNDING
7 100.1440.0046 [ENGINEERING CONSULTANT 9,000.00
100.1440.0011 [ENGINEERING STAFF 9,000.00
- TRANSFER FOR SUPPORT OF ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT FUNCTIONS
8 100.1460.0045 [RECORDS MANAGEMENT STORAGE EXPENSE 500.00
100.1460.0040 [RECORDS MANAGEMENT CONTRACTUAL EXPENSE 500.00
- TRANSFER FOR INCREASED COST OF MICROFILM STORAGE
9 100.1620.0020 [BUILDING EQUIPMENT 2,100.00
100.1620.0040 [BUILDING CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 2,100.00
- TRANSFER FOR PURCHASE OF DEFIBRILLATOR AT TOWN HALL
10 100.1620.0044 [BUILDING MAINTENANCE CONTRACT 9,530.00
100.1990.0040 [CONTINGENCY LINE 9,530.00
- TRANSFER FOR HVAC CONTRACT FROM CONTINGENCY LINE
11 100.3123.0040 [COMMUNITY POLICE EXPENSES 2,000.00
100.1990.0040 [CONTINGENCY LINE 2,000.00
- TRANSFER FOR 'POLICE NIGHT OUT' FROM CONTINGENCY LINE
12 100.8664.0040 [COMPREHENSIVE MASTER PLAN CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 9,400.00
100.1990.0040 [CONTINGENCY LINE 9,400.00
- TRANSFER FOR COMPREHENSIVE ZONING AND PLANNING REVIEW
FROM MASTER PLAN BALANCE IN THE CONTIGENCY LINE
13 100.7114.0040 [RED MILLS CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 2,975.00
100.7110.0040 [PARK CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 2,975.00
- TRANSFER FOR THE COST TO PAINT THE GAZEBO AT RED MILLS
14 100.7450.0044 [MUSEUM ARCHITECT EXPENSE 400.00
100.7450.0040 [MUSEUM CONTRACTUAL EXPENSE 400.00
- TRANSFER FOR BUILDING CONDITION REPORT
15 100.8090.0012 [RECYCLE STAFF OVERTIME 1,143.00
100.8090.0045 [RECYCLE TRASH DISPOSAL 1,143.00
- TRANSFER FOR E-WASTE DAY - EMPLOYEE OVERTIME
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TOWN OF CARMEL

BUDGET REVISIONS APRIL-MAY 2023 #2023/03

INCREASE DECREASE
BUDGET USES & USES &
ACCOUNT TITLE & TRANSFER DESCRIPTION
%i‘ﬁ:lgg ACCOUNT SOURCES OF | SOURCES OF
FUNDS FUNDS
HIGHWAY FUND
16 500.5110.0019 |GENERAL REPAIR ABSENCES 48,487.00
500.5010.9877 |FUND BALANCE FOR COMPENSATED ABSENCES 48,487.00
- PROVIDE FOR PAYOUT OF ACCRUED TIME FOR RETIREE
17 500.5110.0089 |HIGHWAY STAFF MEDICAL EXAMS 100.00
500.5110.0087 |DISABILITY INSURANCE EXPENSE 100.00
- TRANSFER FOR HIGHWAY STAFF MEDICAL EXAMS
CARMEL WATER DISTRICT #4
18 604.8310.0048 |OTHER OPERATING EXPENSES 1,000.00
604.8310.0040 |CONTRACTUAL EXPENSE 1,000.00
- TRANSFER FOR SAMPLING
CARMEL WATER DISTRICT #8
19 608.9902.0099 | TRANSFER TO CAPITAL FUND 33,000.00
608.8310.0090 |CONTINGENCY ACCOUNT 13,000.00
608.8310.9909 |APPROPRIATED FUND BALANCE 20,000.00
- PROVIDE AND TRANSFER FOR TRANSFER TO CAPITAL FUND FOR
WATER TANK PROJECT
CARMEL WATER DISTRICT #9
20 609.9902.0099 | TRANSFER TO CAPITAL FUND 9,500.00
609.8310.0099 |REPAIR RESERVE FUND 9,500.00
- TRANSFER FOR TRANSFER TO CAPITAL FUND FOR WATER TANK
PROJECT
CARMEL WATER DISTRICT #14
21 614.8310.0040 |CONTRACTUAL REPAIRS 5,000.00
614.8310.0047 |EMERGENCY REPAIRS 30,000.00
614.8310.0020 |EQUIPMENT 5,000.00
614.8310.0099 |REPAIR RESERVE 10,000.00
614.8310.9909 |APPROPRIATED FUND BALANCE 20,000.00
- TRANSFER AND PROVIDE FOR CONTRACTUAL AND EMERGENCY
EXPENSES
CARMEL SEWER DISTRICT #2
22 702.8130.0046 |PURCHASE OF WATER 2,000.00
702.8130.0040 |CONTRACTUAL REPAIR 2,000.00
- TRANSFER FOR PURCHASE OF WATER
CARMEL SEWER DISTRICT #3
23 703.8130.0040 |CONTRACTUAL EXPENSE 5,000.00
703.8130.0099 |REPAIR RESERVE 2,000.00
703.8130.9909 |APPROPRIATED FUND BALANCE 3,000.00
- TRANSFER AND PROVIDE FOR UNFORSEEN SEWER LATERAL
EXPENSE
CARMEL SEWER DISTRICT #4
24 704.8130.0046 |PURCHASE OF WATER 2,000.00
704.8130.0040 |CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 2,000.00
- TRANSFER FOR PURCHASE OF WATER
DRAINAGE CAPITAL PROJECT
25 900.1989.0012 |PROJECT OVERTIME EXPENSE 18,000.00
900.1989.0040 |CONTRACTUAL EXPENDITURES 175,000.00
900.1989.0048 |OTHER PROJECT EXPENDITURES 5,500.00
900.1989.0080 |FICA/MED EXPENSE 1,500.00
900.1989.5710 |PROCEEDS OF BORROWING 200,000.00
- RECORD 2023 CAPITAL AUTHORIZATION
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TOWN OF CARMEL
BUDGET REVISIONS APRIL-MAY 2023 #2023/03

INCREASE | DECREASE
BUDGET USES & USES &
ACCOUNT TITLE & TRANSFER DESCRIPTION
ﬁ‘ﬁ;‘gg‘ ACCOUNT SOURCES OF | SOURCES OF
FUNDS FUNDS
SPECIAL DRAINAGE CAPITAL PROJECT
26 902.1989.0045 |[CONTRACTED IMPROVEMENTS 697,000.00
902.1989.5710 |PROCEEDS OF BORROWING 697,000.00
- RECORD 2023 CAPITAL AUTHORIZATION
HIGHWAY RESURFACING CAPITAL PROJECT
27 950.5112.0012 [PROJECT OVERTIME 9,000.00
950.5112.0045 |[CONTRACTED PAVING SERVICES 875,000.00
950.5112.0048 [OTHER PROJECT EXPENDITURES 15,000.00
950.5112.0082 [FICA/MED EXPENSE 1,000.00
950.5112.5710 |PROCEEDS OF BORROWING 900,000.00
- RECORD 2023 CAPITAL AUTHORIZATION
HIGHWAY SPECIAL IMPROVEMENT CAPITAL PROJECT
28 952.5112.0099 |[TRANSFER TO DEBT FUND 238.02
952.5112.9909 (APPROPRIATED FUND BALANCE 238.02
- TRANSFER REMAINING BALANCE AND CLOSE CAPITAL PROJECT
CARMEL WATER DISTRICT #9 CAPITAL PROJECT
29 969.8310.0099 [TRANSFER TO DEBT FUND 6,089.93
969.8310.9909 (APPROPRIATED FUND BALANCE 6,089.93
- TRANSFER REMAINING BALANCE AND CLOSE CAPITAL PROJECT
MISCELLANEOUS CAPITAL FUNDS
30 960.8310.0040 |WD#10 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 12,800.00
961.8310.0040 |WD#1 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 7,112.00
969.8310.0040 [(WD#9 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 146,688.00
983.8310.0040 [WD#13 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 8,404.00
960.8310.5710 |PROCEEDS OF BORROWING 12,800.00
961.8310.5710 |PROCEEDS OF BORROWING 7,112.00
969.8310.5710 |PROCEEDS OF BORROWING 146,688.00
983.8310.5710 |PROCEEDS OF BORROWING 8,404.00
- PROVIDE FOR CAPITAL PROJECT COSTS FROM APPROVED
BORROWING (STORAGE TANK REHAB)
MISCELLANEOUS CAPITAL FUNDS
31 968.8310.0040 |(WD#8 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 33,000.00
969.8310.0040 [(WD#9 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 9,500.00
968.8310.5031 TRANSFER FROM OPERATION FUND #608 33,000.00
969.8310.5030 |TRANSFER FROM OPERATION FUND #609 9,500.00
- PROVIDE FOR CAPITAL PROJECT COSTS FROM TRANSFER FROM
OPERATING FUNDS (STORAGE TANK REHAB)
MISCELLANEOUS CAPITAL FUNDS
32 960.8310.0040 [WD#10 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 1,693.00
961.8310.0040 |(WD#1 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 798.00
962.8310.0040 |(WD#2 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 28,600.00
963.8310.0040 |(WD#3 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 5,170.00
968.8310.0040 [(WD#8 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 5,078.00
969.8310.0040 |(WD#9 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 320.00
983.8310.0040 [WD#13 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 1,111.00
984.8310.0040 [(WD#14 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 7,230.00
960.8310.3000 |STATE AID - GRANT FUNDS 1,693.00
961.8310.3000 |STATE AID - GRANT FUNDS 798.00
962.8310.3000 |STATE AID - GRANT FUNDS 28,600.00
963.8310.3000 |STATE AID - GRANT FUNDS 5,170.00
968.8310.3000 |STATE AID - GRANT FUNDS 5,078.00
969.8310.3000 |STATE AID - GRANT FUNDS 320.00
983.8310.3000 |STATE AID - GRANT FUNDS 1,111.00
984.8310.3000 |STATE AID - GRANT FUNDS 7,230.00

- PROVIDE FOR CAPITAL PROJECT COSTS FROM GRANT AID (STORAGE

TANK REHAB)
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TOWN OF CARMEL
BUDGET REVISIONS APRIL-MAY 2023 #2023/03

INCREASE | DECREASE
R’BI;JV[I)SGII(EJ-L ACCOUNT ACCOUNT TITLE & TRANSFER DESCRIPTION USES & USES &
TR SOURCES OF | SOURCES OF

FUNDS FUNDS

MISCELLANEOUS CAPITAL FUNDS

33 960.8310.0040 |WD#10 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 4,828.00
961.8310.0040 |WD#1 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 1,207.00
962.8310.0040 |WD#2 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 135,745.00
963.8310.0040 |WD#3 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 7,843.00
968.8310.0040 |WD#8 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 26,244.00
969.8310.0040 |WD#9 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 5,128.00
983.8310.0040 |WD#13 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 3,169.00
984.8310.0040 |WD#14 CAPITAL FUND - CONTRACTUAL EXPENSES 13,876.00
960.8310.4300 |FEDERAL AID - ARPA FUNDS 4,828.00
961.8310.4300 |FEDERAL AID - ARPA FUNDS 1,207.00
962.8310.4300 |FEDERAL AID - ARPA FUNDS 135,745.00
963.8310.4300 |FEDERAL AID - ARPA FUNDS 7,843.00
968.8310.4300 |FEDERAL AID - ARPA FUNDS 26,244.00
969.8310.4300 |FEDERAL AID - ARPA FUNDS 5,128.00
983.8310.4300 |FEDERAL AID - ARPA FUNDS 3,169.00
984.8310.4300 |FEDERAL AID - ARPA FUNDS 13,876.00

- PROVIDE FOR CAPITAL PROJECT COSTS FROM FEDERAL AID - ARPA
FUNDS (STORAGE TANK REHAB)
CARMEL SEWER DISTRICT #5 CAPITAL PROJECT

34 975.8130.0046 | TECHNICAL SERVICES 24,000.00

975.8130.0044 |PROJECT ENGINEERING 24,000.00

- TRANSFER FOR CAPITAL PROJECT COST
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